
7813 €/m2

For sale | Flat
Monsummano Terme,
Price

1500000 €

Description

Monsummano Terme, Tuscany - Pistoia:

Within a small medieval village dating
back to the eleventh century, close to
major tourist destinations of Tuscany,
easily reachable from the exit of
Montecatini Terme, splendid resort built
in a former convent. 
The location, on top of a hill, you enjoy a
360 ° panoramic view of the surrounding
park and the village millennium, as well
as on six Tuscan provinces. 

The renovation, carried out with great
care of every detail, has created a
pleasant and welcoming environment. 

The contrast between old and new
creates a relaxed and informal
atmosphere. 
Ground floor: living room and dining
room with kitchenette, storage,
bathroom and two bedrooms with en
suite bathroom. 
On the first floor there are two bedrooms
with en suite bathroom, hallway and
suites with wardrobe and bathroom en
suite. 

The rooms are all equipped with
bathroom, computerized temperature
control, minibar, safe, tea sets, LCD
satellite TV, hairdryer, courtesy set. 

This property, functioning as a luxury
Relais, is also suitable as a private

residence.

Area: 192 m2

Rooms: 9
Floors:
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